METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE CLIMATE
CONTROL A/C AND BLOWER PARTS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:

BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4017000241
09/21/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.|[NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Ttem 2 ftem 8 ftem 12 Item 14 item 15 REMARKS
1. |GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA 94545 $1.429.48 $2,845.96 $9,992.55 $2,219.08 $11,549.10
2. [MCI
LOUISVILLE, KY 40258 $1,448.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. |PREVOST CAR (US) INC.
ELGIN, IN 60123 $1,526.04 $3,043.16 $10,692.00 $2,372.20 $12,000.00
4. IMUNCIE
MUNCIE, IN 47302 $1,473.00 NO BID $10,359.09 NO BID NO BID
5. INEW FLYER PARTS
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $1,636.00 $3,160.00 NO BID $2,552.00 $12,400.00
6 |[NEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $2,400.00 $4,000.00 NO BID $2,644.80 NO BID
7
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE CLIMATE CONTROL

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000241
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/21/2017 @ 10:00AM
NO.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER ltem 3 ftem 11 REMARKS
1. INEW FLYER PARTS

DELAWARE, OH 43015 $8,946.00 $792.00
2. INEOPART TRANSIT

READING, PA 19608 $9,586.08 NO BID
3. [MUNCIE

MUNCIE, IN 47302 $10,616.49 NO BID
4. IMCl

LOUISVILLE, KY 40258 $10,674.00 NO BID
5. |PREVOST CAR (US) INC.

ELGIN, IN 60123 $11,002.41 NO BID
6 |GILLIG LLC

HAYWARD, CA 94545 $11,356.47 NO BID
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE CLIMATE CONTROL

SOLICITATION NO.:

BID

OPENING DATE/TIME:

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

4017000241
09/21/2017 @ 10:00AM

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

NO.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 5 Item 10 Item 16 REMARKS
1. |PREVOST CAR (US) INC.
ELGIN, IN 60123 $6,889.08 $589.28 $3,432.87
2. INEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $6,930.36 $719.72 $3,754.80
3. |MCI
LOUISVILLE, KY 40258 $7,641.60 $1,451.06 NO BID
4. IMUNCIE
MUNCIE, IN 47302 $7,962.90 NO BID $4,210.29
5. INEW FLYER PARTS
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $8,640.00 NO BID $4,221.00
6 |GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA 94545 NO BID $782.79 $4,059.09
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE CLIMATE

CONTROL A/C AND BLOWER PARTS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES
SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4017000241

09/21/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Ttem 4 tem 6 ftem 7 ftem O ltem 13 Ttem 17 REMARKS
1. [INEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $12,082.32 $13,423.20 $4,118.38 $3,784.20 $1,774.96 $9,690.00
2. [MUNCIE
MUNCIE, IN 47302 $13,331.01 | $15,809.70 | $4,435.76 $4,382.28 $2,024.96 | $10,552.00
3. |PREVOST CAR (US) INC.
ELGIN, IN 60123 $13,851.00 NO BID $4,663.61 $4,558.68 $2,068.71 | $17,415.00
4. INEW FLYER PARTS
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $14,400.00 | $16,500.00 | $4,830.00 $4,200.00 NO BID $11,700.00
5. [MCI
LOUISVILLE, KY 40258 NO BID $14,910.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9,720.00
6 |GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA 94545 NO BID $14,975.25 | $4,300.87 $4,276.02 NO BID $9,918.00
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| certify that | have persondlly 0;54=ned anl:l rea II bids received’by the time set for receipt.
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| have reviewed and erified the
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MOBILE CLIMATE CONTROL

SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000241
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/21/2017 @ 10:00AM
NO.INAME AND CITY OF BIDDER [tem 1 REMARKS
1. IMUNCIE
MUNCIE, IN 47302 $2,451.84
2. |PREVOST CAR (US) INC.
ELGIN, IN 60123 $2,532.72
3. INEW FLYER PARTS
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $2,640.00
4. INEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $3,200.00
5. |GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA 94545 $3,099.12
6 |[McClI
LOUISVILLE, KY 40258 NO BID
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| certify that | hiave pérsanallyop W&ived by the time set for receipt. | have reviewed and/vegified the pfide
RS AW stated hereip.
Contrac?t‘Administrd\_t}rl IR Maradef of Pracliremént
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