METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE PARTS
FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.
BID OPENING DATE/TIME

IFB 4017000262
11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 2 item 3 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 9 Item 10 ltem 11 Item 13 Item 14 Item 15 Item 16 Item 17
1. |STEWART & STEVENSON LLC

Houston, TX 77251 $46,754.84 | $1,161.42 | $4,196.68 | $1,107.12 | $32,953.22 | $9,490.50 | $12,254.34 $448.11 $7,436.25 | $23,890.65 | $403.15 | $5,912.07 | $5,632.69 | $49,301.70
2. |AJL PROJECT SERVICES

Dallas, TX 75243 $75,538.72 $8,566.05 | $7,709.32 | $2,040.00 NO BID NO BID $20,363.04 $834.66 $13,658.75 NO BID $744.80 NO BID | $10,735.41 | $76,356.00
3. [IMOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES

Louisville, KY 40258 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36,016.40 NO BID $13,387.41 NO BID $8,127.45 NQ BID NO BID NO BID $6,153.28 | $53,883.48
4, IMOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY CO.

Niles, IL 60714 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5, |HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER

Houston, TX 770229 $22,989.68 $571.08 $2,063.52 $544.38 $16,203.58 | $4,666.44 $7,818.72 $220.32 $3,656.45 $11,747.38 | $198.25 $2,907.23 | $3,592.54 | $24,241.98
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE PARTS

FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.
BID OPENING DATE/TIME

IFB 4017000262

11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BIiD ABSTRACT

NO.INAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Ttem 18 Ttem 19 ltem20 | Item 21 Ttem 22 Tltem 23 item 24 Ttem 26 item 27 item 28 item 29 item 30 item 31 item 32 ftem 33
1. |[STEWART & STEVENSON LLC

Houston, TX 77251 $3,184.02 | $6,130.69 | $3,643.39 | $7,009.28 | $26,286.90 | $5,821.20 | $6,893.84 | $1,404.78 | $6,139.98 | $5,993.91 $669.20 | $1,820.50 | $3,061.50 | $6,469.58 | $3,380.52
2. |AJL PROJECT SERVICES

Dallas, TX 75243 $5,733.00 | $10,602.30 | $6,717.89 |$13,616.00] NO BID $9,836.95 NO BID $2,415.54 NO BID |$11,021.03| $1,228.85 | $3,419.50 | $5,446.00 | $11,914.24 | $6,331.00
3. IMOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES

Louisville, KY 40258 NO BID $6,700.04 | $3,982.23 | $7,663.44 NO BID NO BID $7,535.05 | $1,688.76 NO BID NO BID $731.35 $1,990.50 | $3,347.00 | $7,133.10 | $4,064.32
4, IMOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY CO. X

Niles, IL 60714 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | $2,119.50 NO BID NO BID
5. [HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER

Houston, TX 770229 $1,565.34 | $3,014.90 | $1,791.38 | $3,445.44 NO BID $2,862.30 | $3,389.94 $690.78 $3,015.60 | $2,947.37 $329.05 $895.00 | $1,505.50 | $3,181.10 NO BID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE PARTS
FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO. IFB 4017000262

BID OPENING DATE/TIME  11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.

NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER

item 34 iftem 35 | item36 | item 37 item 38 item 39 item 40 item 41 ftem 42

REMARKS

. |STEWART & STEVENSON LLC

Houston, TX 77251

$4,114.50 | $7,652.25 | $953.42 | $4,377.84 | $22,455.70 | $1,415.31 | $4,305.96 | $2,034.12 | $1,063.68

AJL PROJECT SERVICES
Dallas, TX 75243

$7,624.50 |$14,501.75| $1,786.57 | $8,191.34 | $38,011.51 | $2,072.97 | $7,902.00 | $3,740.79 | $1,975.76

MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES
Louisville, KY 40258

$4,498.00 | $8,355.25 | $1,205.93 | $4,783.84 NO BID NO BID $4,706.04 | $2,223.18 | $1,162.48

MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY CO.

Niles, IL 60714

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Item 31 Non-responsive

HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER
Houston, TX 770229

$2,023.00 | $4,883.00 | $468.73 | $2,152.96 | $11,041.30 | $548.40 $2,117.28 | $1,000.20 | $523.04

Non-responsive bid

10

PAGE 3 OF 3




METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF DETROIT DIESEL ENGINE PARTS
FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO. [FB 4017000262

BID OPENING DATE/TIME _ 11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER [ Ttem 12 Ttem 25 REMARKS
1. [MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY CO.

Niles, IL 60714 $4,968.00 | $3,818.09
2. [MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES

Louisville, KY 40258 $10,067.40 | $7,065.09
3. |STEWART & STEVENSON

Houston, TX 77251 $11,742.30 | $6,465.35
4. |AJL PROJECT SERVICES

Dallas, TX 75243 $20,764.20 | $12,162.88
5. |HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER

Houston, TX 770229 $5,773.80 | $3,178.24 Non responsive
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