METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF RELIABILT ENGINE PARTS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:

4017000263

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 2	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	REMARKS
	CTEMART & CTEVENCON						
0.2	STEWART & STEVENSON Houston, TX 77251-1637	\$39,314.64	\$66,462.48	\$53,040.96	\$77,780.93	\$184,215.54	
	AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC. Dallas, TX 75243	\$39,516.00	\$70,056.00	\$55,872.00	\$80,095.00	\$188,181.00	
3.	MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES Louisville, KY 40258	\$53,128.80	\$84,134.40	NO BID	\$78,888.75	\$197,925.00	
١.	HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER Houston, TX 77029	\$13,724.40	\$18,222.96	\$14,028.48		\$46,884.30	NON RESPONSIVE
ī.,		\$10,724.40	ψ10,222.00	\$14,020.40	Ψ21,010.0 4	\$40,004.50	NON KEOF ONOIVE
3		†					
7							
3	4						
9							
0							

certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.	I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.
thus mal as	An 8. must
Contract Administrator I	Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF RELIABILT ENGINE PARTS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000263

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 4	Item 6	Item 13	REMARKS
1.	MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES				
is:	Louisville, KY 40258	\$53,820.00	\$37,260.00	\$34,347.20	
2.	AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.	\$33,020.00	ψ51,200.00	ψ5 1,51 .20	
	Dallas, TX 75243	\$95,550.00	\$40,725.00	\$37,800.00	
3.	STEWART & STEVENSON				
	Houston, TX 77251-1637	\$102,903.90	\$37,664.10	\$49,232.96	
	HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER				
-	Houston, TX 77029	\$53,025.60	\$10,476.00	\$9,291.04	NON RESPONSIVE
5.					
6					
٥					
7					
8					1 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2
					41
9					
10		1/	10		
co.f	ify that I have personally opened and re-	d all hide receives	by the time as	t for receipt	I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF RELIABILT ENGINE PARTS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:

4017000263

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 11/30/2017 @ 10:00AM

			TOTAL	BID AMOUNT			
NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 1	Item 3	item 5	Item 11	Item 12	REMARKS
1.	AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.						
	Dallas, TX 75243	\$9,498.00	\$48,528.75	\$9,730.00	\$5,522.00	\$32,420.50	
	MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES						
_	Louisville, KY 40258	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,208.00	\$5,757.40	NO BID	
	HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER						
	Houston, TX 77029	\$3,786.56	\$19,299.50	\$4,951.94	\$2,003.98	\$107.72	NON RESPONSIVE
	STEWART & STEVENSON						
	Houston, TX 77251-1637	\$9,599.76	\$51,128.50	\$18,508.24	\$5,659.61	\$38,475.22	
5.							
6							
7				\$.			
8					-		
9							
19	that I have described						

Contract Administrator I

Contract Administr