METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4018000027
1/4/2018 @ 10:30AM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

KENILWORTH, NJ 07033

NO| NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER a7 T Tiem 6 T Ttem 9 T Tem 10 em 11 lem 13 | Tem 14 | Tem 15 | Tem 16 |
[ Lo $2,965.32 | $10,004.40 | $35,007.72 | $13,035.44 | $1,031.40 | $25020.92 | $3,877.80 | $3,215.68 | $197.40
HAYWARD, CA 94545 ! ) v - ’ . ’ " ’ - y . » . ; 3 .

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO, LLC

2. DELAWARE, OH 43015 $3,283.02 $15,359.40 $37,315.19 $14,337.40 $1,175.22 $26,059.62 $4,141.40 $3,476.32 $206.96
NEOPART TRANSIT

3. READING, PA 19608 NO BID $14,125.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MUNCIE

4, MUNCIE. IN $3,611.24 $18,171.72 $38,417.50 $13,625.04 $1,256.22 $26,002.28 $4,132.00 $3,492.48 $216.84
PREVOST CAR INC

5. ELGIN, IL 60123 NO BID $17,411.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27,794.86 NO BID $3,533.76 $216.80

6. PRGN T s IER $3,762.00 $19,933.20 NO BID NO BID $1,307.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

| certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

-

~—

/Contréct Administrator

PAGE 1 OF 2

| have reviewed an
®.7 %4

Manager of Procuremenf

erified the prices stated herein.



DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:

BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4018000027

1/4/12018 @ 10:30AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

ftem 18 ftem 23 ftem 25 | item 28 item 29 item 30 item 31 item 33 | Item 35 REMARKS |
$11,804.46 | $853.56 $906.66 $2,4563.88 | $6,154.88 $423.12 $2,148.72 | $8,842.38 | $1,995.78
$12,323.13 | $979.56 $979.68 NOBID | $7,271.43 $485.56 $2,542.47 | $10,071.65 | $2,214.45

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
$12,513.36 $977.58 $984.69 $2,509.48 | $17,059.58 | $484.56 $2,460.36 | $10,641.49 | $3,401.04
$13,124.34 | NO BID $992.97 $2,680.60 | $7,779.99 $499.72 $2,421.30 | $10,729.21 | $2,316.57

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $11,126.50 | NO BID

| certifg thatfl have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.
/—-—7

S—

~"Conffact Administrator

PAGE 2 OF 2

| have reviewed and
oin £

Wrices stated herein.
L

Manager of Procurement



DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES
SOLICITATION NO.:

BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4018000027
1/4/2018 @ 10:30AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

NO

NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

ftem 7

ftem 8 ftem 12 ftem 17 REMARKS
1. ﬁgﬁﬁ'&:’oﬁ%‘?&'ﬂzggmm $4,014.40 | $46,260.00 | $5,250.00 | $567.00
2, ;:f:&:i’;‘y‘gg':g;ZARTs co,LLC $4,227.60 $60,117.44 $8,197.35 NO BID
3. :E:;::ZI: ;iﬁ’;g&; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. mg:g:s’ IN NO BID NO BID $9,115.05 NO BID
5. :E(E;:;?ISJS%?ZR;NC NO BID NO BID NO BID $880.56
6. g:-YL\II?AII-RIE)? CA 94545 NO BID NO BID NO BID $724.32
| certify.that ! pave personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. | have reviewe anWrices stated herein.
g oy A :

“Contrdct Administrator

PAGE 1 OF 1

Manager of Procurement




METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4018000027
1/4/12018 @ 10:30AM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

NO

NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

ftem 1 ftem 2 [tem 3 ftem 5 REMARKS

1. 2:23&21: lm’;:&: $3,511.80 $234.12 $2,381.88 $3,624.60

2 ;:EI-\AV'\:I;E;I,WQSIZE;ZARTS €O, LLe $3,834.15 $255.61 $2,568.87 $3,909.15

3 mg:g:s’ IN $4,611.00 $307.40 $3,089.36 $4,701.20

4. :E(E;:;J?ISLTG%??;NC NO BID $289.78 $2,912.03 $4,431.35

5. zg:isrol:;;(,)&P:ﬁ);:TERY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6. ﬁ:‘YL‘:\?A;I;; CA 94545 $3,608.70 $240.58 $2,417.76 $3,679.20
I ce hat | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Corﬂ’ract Administrator

PAGE 1 OF 1

| have reweweg/a ?verlfed th?prlces stated herein.

Manager of Procurement




METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT ’

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES
SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000027

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 1/4/2018 @ 10:30AM RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM REMARKS

NO| NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER [tem 20 ftem 21 ftem 24 [tem 26 item 27

1. MONGIE $4,184.04 $1,433.16 $1,758.24 $190.55 $1,317.33

MUNCIE, IN

R R ARSI CO, ELE $4,451.16 NO BID NO BID $268.80 $1,593.63

DELAWARE, OH 43015

NEOPART TRANSIT

3. READING, PA 19608 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PREVOST CAR INC

4 ELGIN, IL 60123 $4,697.70 NO BID $2,430.24 $374.16 $1,604.25

5 R OIS TER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

KENILWORTH, NJ 07033

GILLIG LLC

6. HAYWARD, CA 94545 $4,277.28 NO BID $2,157.12 $341.64 $1,465.02
| c@that\l have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. | have reviewez? verified the prices stated herein.
/-'7'
7~ Confract Administrator Manager of Procurement /

PAGE 1 OF 1



DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SEAT PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES
SOLICITATION NO.:

BID OPENING DATEI/TIME:

4018000027
1/4/2018 @ 10:30AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

HAYWARD, CA 94545

NO| NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER  [—fr=7 e T Ton 3t EETTARIS
1 ;:E :viliﬁ?"gﬁ'ﬁig 1';ARTS CO.LLC| ¢1,080.60 | $1,981.35 $680.34
2 zgggl‘:g :i’:’;g&: NOBID | NOBID NO BID
3 mg:g:: " $1,507.05 | $2,689.75 $829.60
4 ZEE:LOISLT 6%?2"3'"(; $1,522.60 | $2,611.0 $838.80
5. ss:&s&‘o‘;ﬁrﬂ’;ﬁgmm NOBID | NOBID NO BID
6. [CILLIG LLC NOBID | $2,384.40 $763.84

lc

ify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

e

~ Co

nfract Administrator

PAGE 1 OF 1

| have reviez?We prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement /




