DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF BRAKE DRUMS
FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000092
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 03/22/2018 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: FATIMA N. RUBIO
NAME AND TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM
NO CITY OF BIDDER Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 5 REMARKS
New Flyer Parts
1 |Delaware, OH $10,368.00 $108,577.70 $39,660.00 $11,397.76
AJL Projects Svcs. Inc.
2 |Dallas, TX $297,000.00 $386,155.00 $146,000.00 $32,560.00
Southern Coach Parts Company
3 |Birmingham, AL NO BID $129,095.54 $41,730.00 $11,823.24
Prevost Car Inc.
4 |Elgin, IL NO BID $139,858.32 $43,350.00 $11,976.36
Axletech, LLC
5 |Troy, Ml NO BID $150,592.19 $42,578.00 $12,253.56
Muncie Transit Supply
6 |Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID $51,168.00 $13,314.40
MCI Service Parts
7 |Louisville, KY NO BID NO BID NO BID $12,240.80
ad all bids received by the time set for receipt. | have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

OluA

Contract Administrator | Manager of Procurement L




DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF BRAKE DRUMS

FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES
SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000092

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 03/22/2018 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCELLA ABBS

NAME AND

NO CITY OF BIDDER Item 4 REMARKS
Southern Coach Parts Company

1 |Birmingham, AL $19,170.48
New Flyer Parts

2 |Delaware, OH $19,751.20
Prevost Car Inc.

3 |Elgin, IL $19,992.00
Axletech, LLC

4 |Troy, Mi $20,072.64
MCI Service Parts

5 |Louisville, KY $20,552.00
Muncie Transit Supply

6 |Muncie, IN $23,301.60
AJL Projects Svcs. Inc.
Dallas, TX $46,480.00

rtlfy that | have person

Contract Administrator |

opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

| have reviewed and verlflid the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement




