METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000142
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 06/28/2018 @ 10:00AM

NO.INAME AND CITY OF BIDDER [ Item 2 tem 3 tem 14 ftem 24 ltem 26 ftem 30 | item 33 REMARKS

1. INEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $1,058.20 $9,219.20 $527.25 $5,390.56 $37,784.80 $9,984.45 | $16,279.14

2. |[PREVOST
ELGIN, IL 60123 $1,069.20 | $11,226.60 | $1,731.85 | g6,917.68 | $48,043.40 | $12,970.65 | NO BID

SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS,
3. JINC.
SAN CARLOS, CA 94070 $1,175.90 $11,057.00 $2,023.50 $6,661.20 $55,261.00 | $10,279.50 NO BID

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS
4. |CO,LLC
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $1,190.20 | $14,400.00 $2,566.90 | $10,326.40 | $44,311.00 | $12,022.50 NO BID

NATSCO TRANSIT
5. |SOLUTIONS
SMITHTOWN, NY 11787 $1,181.18 NO BID $2,091.90 $6,694.24 | $57,212.29 | $11,890.20 | $17,805.15

AJL PROJECT SERVICES
6 |INC.
DALLAS, TX 75243 $1,936.00 | $23,440.00 | $4,940.00 | $12,600.00 | $91,469.00 | $23,415.00 | $26,775.00

N A | " / 4]

hat | havi personally opened and fead all bids | have reviewed andl vefified the pyles stated herein.
Mgnger o; éro%r%nent

ontract{Administrator |
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF
TRANSMISSION PARTS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000142
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 06/28/2018 @ 10:00AM

NO |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Ttem 1 Ttem 8 Ttem 9§ Ttem 12 Ttem15 | ftem 19 Ttem 20 | Item 23 Ttem 25 item 28 ftem 29 item 32 REMARKS

1. |SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC.

SAN CARLOS, CA 94070 $780.00 $1,003.65 $1,409.00 $46,879.50 $231.25 $234.50 $1,024.00 $9,645.20 $5,491.95 $4,860.00 $1,677.00 $4,756.80
2. |NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS

SMITHTOWN, NY 11787 $784.68 $1,008,45 NO BID $47,173.80 | $2,973.75 NO BID $1,059.65 | $9,970.32 $6,522.70 | $12,102.48 | $1,733.16 | $28,048.32
3. [INEOPART TRANSIT

READING, PA 19608 $912.98 $1,173.84 $1,536.48 $54,909,00 $3,437.50 $738.15 $5,235.38 $11,544.64 $6,427.98 $12,220.56 $2,008.81 $12,359,04
4. |THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO, LLC

DELAWARE, OH 43015 $1,695.20 NO BID NO BID | $102,900.00 | $3,495.00 $777.70 $1,292.00 NO BiD NOBID | $13,348.80 | $2185.30 | $13,205.76
5. |PREVOST

ELGIN, IL 60123 NO BID $1,083.50 $1,433.09 $85,050.00 | $3,948.75 $990.25 $1,255.50 | $10,327.52 $5,729.34 $8,274.24 $2,040.22 $14,969.28
6 |AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.

DALLAS, TX 75243 $2,002.00 $1,935.00 $1,997.00 | $90,750.00 NO BID $1,465.00 $2,260.00 | $22,900.00 | $11,316.00 | $21,096.00 | $3,055.00 NO BID
7
8
9
10
11

| have reviewed and vegfied the prices stated

| cerffy that | have peg Bids received by the time set for receipt.
4 %{ £
™ N ’ -
\) @untracmr Administrator |

Manager of F’rocureﬂlent
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND

DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS

SOLICITATION NO.:

4018000142

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 06/28/2018 @ 10:00AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

No |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER tem 4 ltem & Ttem 6 Ttem 7 ftem 10 ftem 11 Ttem 13 Ttem 16 Ttem 17 Ttem 18 m21 Ttem 22 REMARKS
1. |PREVOST

ELGIN, IL 60123 $457.66 $3,088.15 $2,916.00 $2,835.00 | $1,782.00 $729.00 $2,389.50 $1,018.28 $2,794.56 $4,252.50 | $3,807.72 | $11,048.48
2. |SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC.

SAN CARLOS, CA 94070 $538.60 $3,427.25 $4,014.70 | $3,398.50 | $2,060.50 $1,046.55 | $3,316.00 $4,553.10 $3,035.40 $4,375.00 $3,916.50 | $11,424.00
3. [NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS

SMITHTOWN, NY 11787 $541.42 $3,451.70 $4,038,30 NO BID $2,075.50 | $1,055.7¢ NO BID $4,716.18 $3,144.12 $4,521.40 NOBID | $11,797.60
4. INEOPART TRANSIT

READING, PA 19608 $620.98 §4,013.55 $4,700.30 $3,971.38 $2,415.70 $1,228.95 $3,993.30 $9,333,00 $3,640.68 $5,235.38 $4,685.52 $23,964.96
5. |THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO, LLC

DELAWARE, OH 43015 $1,380.40 NO BID $6,326.00 $7,084.00 $5,186.00 $2,550.00 $3,632.00 | $10,856.00 $2,964.00 $5,512.00 $4,938.36 | $14,400.00
6 |AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.

DALLAS, TX 75243 $1,402.00 $7,275.00 $6,606.00 NO BID $3,980.00 $2,019.00 $3,810.00 $8,910.00 $5,940.00 $9,050.00 $7,266.00 NO BID
7
8
]
10
11

™~
| have reviewed and verjfied the prices stated
| certify thad | hpye personall ids receivegl by the time set for receipt.

U v

Contractor Administrator |
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS

SOLICITATION NO. 4018000142
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 06/28/2018 @ 10:00AM

No.|NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER [ Ttem 27 item 31 REMARKS

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS
1. |CO, LLC
DELAWARE, OH 43015 $6,889.40 $3,451.68

SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS,
2. |INC.
SAN CARLOS, CA 94070 $7,940.20 $5,232.60

3. INEOPART TRANSIT
READING, PA 19608 $9,848.66 $5,109.48

4, |PREVOST
ELGIN, IL 60123 $28,022.32 | $5,686.20

NATSCO TRANSIT
5. |SOLUTIONS
SMITHTOWN, NY 11787 $38,950.64 $5,408.64

6 |AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.
DALLAS, TX 75243 $70,522.00 | $24,084.00

| have reviewed

s stated herein.

Manager of Procurement
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