

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF INVENTORY BUS FLUIDS

IFB NO. : 4017000251

BID OPENING: 9-28-2017

TIME: 2:00PM

RECORDED BY: FATIMA RUBIO

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 1 ENGINE ANTI-FREEZE/COOLANT (50/50)	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 2 BULK-SYNTHETIC AUTOMATIC-TRANSMISSION FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 3 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 4 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 C-J-4	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 5 GEAR OIL	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 6 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 API CF-4 CES20085	REMARKS
1.	AJ HURT dba RELADYNE HOUSTON, TX 77021	\$386,130.70	\$723,953.16	\$462,457.80	\$594,594.00	\$186,340.82	\$75,029.68	
2.	SUN COAST RESOURCES, INC HOUSTON, TX 77026	\$419,295.30	NO BID	\$484,479.60	\$564,564.00	\$251,318.91	\$90,068.00	
3.	PORTS PETROLEUM CO, INC WOOSTER, OH 44691	NO BID	NO BID	\$506,501.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4.	PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA 92647	NO BID	NO BID	\$475,670.88	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5.	THREE L, INC HOUSTON, TX 77045	NO BID	\$617,324.40	NO BID	\$780,780.00	NO BID	\$121,440.00	
6.	APACHE OIL COMPANY PASADENA, TX 77505	NO BID	\$622,134.72	NO BID	\$554,954.40	\$170,110.49	\$75,090.40	
7.								
8.								
9.								
10.								

certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

*Fatima Rubio*  
Contract Administrator

*Michael S. Howell*  
Manager of Procurement