METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS
SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000246
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:  09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN
TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM
NO [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER ltem 3 ltem 21 ltem 29 Item 33 ltem 34 ([ Iltem 35 REMARKS
2| [AORAWK MEGIAND SUPREY-CO: $1,360.80 | $49,975.75 | $1,487.31 | $12,477.50 | $8,583.30 |$1,040.00
NILES, ILLINOIS 60714
2 [THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO., LLC | ¢12,256.92 | $69,300.00 | $3,335.18 | $21,700.00 |$12,148.20 |$1,650.00
DELAWARE, OH
3 [SOUTHERN COACH PARTS $6,667.92 | $61,418.50 | $2,884.48 | $21,904.60 |$13,656.78 |$1,395.80
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236
4 |SMHIG, LLC $6,954.66 | $62,276.50 | $2,884.48 | $19,192.10 |$11,805.48 | $1,454.10
HAYWARD, CA
5 [AXLETECH $1,438.56 | NOBID | $1,622.52 NO BID NOBID | NOBID
TROY, MI 48083
g |WUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY $7,124.76 | $50,545.00 | $2,794.34 | $16,337.00 |$13,315.59 | $1,480.80
MUNCIE, IN
7 |NEOPART TRANSIT, LLC. $6,667.92 | $57,057.00 | $2,884.48 | $17,521.20 |$10,777.32 |$1,393.80
READING, PA 19608
g |[/FHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID
BOCA RATON, FL
g |MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES NOBID | $73,150.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID
LOUISVILLE, KY
10 ::::’:SI: CAR, INC. $7,324.02 | $63,992.50 | $2,920.55 | $20,320.50 |$12,362.40 | $1,494.80
14 |CBM US INC. $9,185.40 | $66,750.75 | $3,064.76 NO BID NOBID |$1,561.00
CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138
12 [WIDWEST BUS CORP $1,704.82 | $63,635.00 | $2,794.34 | $18,674.40 |$12,925.44 |$1,485.80
OWOSCO, MI 48867
13 |T'LES IN STYLE $25,442.10 | $265,366.75 | $6,120.52 | $46,512.40 |$22,129.92 |$7,968.10 | NON-RESPONSIVE
WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527
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