
METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY 
BID ABSTRACT 

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS 
SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000246 
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN 

TOTAL BIO AMOUNT BY ITEM 
NO NAME ANO CITY OF BIDDER Item 1 Item 2 Item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7 Item 8 Item 11 

1 
NEOPART TRANSIT, LLC. 

$10,007.52 $1,150.84 $98,820.74 $12,842.50 $9,235.94 $1,877.52 $14,065.38 $1,669.44 
READING, PA 19608 

2 
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO., LLC 

$16,800.00 $1,330.00 $150,653.00 $13,200.00 $10,360.00 $2,180.00 $15,930.00 $1,764.54 
DELAWARE, OH 

3 
SOUTHERN COACH PARTS 

$10,016.64 $1,437.73 $101,414.26 $13,202.75 $12,383.49 $2,562.54 $14,084.01 
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236 

$1,941.30 

4 
GILLIG, LLC 

$10,440.72 NOBID $105,666.87 $13,385.90 NOBID NOBID $14,674.23 $1,828.77 
HAYWARD, CA 

5 
AXLETECH 

NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID 
TROY, Ml 48083 

6 
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY 

$10,572.48 $1,454.07 $110,644.14 $13,712.60 $9,904.23 $2,361.63 $15,087.60 $1,808.37 
MUNCIE, IN 

7 
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM 

NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID 
BOCA RATON, FL 

8 
MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES 

NO BID NO BID $113,085.10 NOBID $11,206.30 NOBID NOBID $2,330.40 
LOUISVILL, KY 

9 
PREVOST CAR, INC. 

$11,053.44 $1,409.96 $108,622.72 $14,220.80 $10,421.18 $2,207.85 $15,816.60 $1,878.60 
ELGIN, IL 

10 
CBM US INC. 

$14,196.00 NOBID $143,311.05 $17,864.00 NOBID NOBID $19,402.74 NOBID 
CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138 

11 
MOHAWK MFG AND SUPPLY CO. NOBID NOBID $122,353.12 NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
NILES, ILLINOIS 60714 

12 
MIDWEST BUS CORP 

$10,668.72 $1,704.82 $107,974.34 $13,678.50 $9,846.76 $2,341.92 $14,994.72 $1,779.72 
OWOSCO Ml 48867 
TILES IN STYLE 

$30,884.04 $2,446.48 $289,768.65 $30,286.30 $20,068.86 $4,009.38 $45,319.77 $3,617.97 13 
WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527 

t I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. 
,. ( 

-,, 
I have cev;e~~rtenrices stated herein 

t / ' 
~ 

Manager of Procurement 

/ 



METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY 
BID ABSTRACT 

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS 
SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000246 
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN 

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM 
NO NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 13 Item 14 Item 15 Item 17 Item 18 Item 19 Item 20 Item 24 

1 
NEOPART TRANSIT, LLC. 

$11,201.20 $759.20 $6,412.56 $11,168.56 $13,531.14 $12,242.44 $6,786.00 $1,987.80 
READING, PA 19608 

2 
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO., LLC 

$11,808.00 $860.00 $6,468.00 $14,040.00 $16,506.00 $13,892.00 $9,000.00 $2,680.00 
DELAWARE, OH 

3 
SOUTHERN COACH PARTS 

$11,763.72 $972.84 $6,680.08 $11,177.92 $13,542.48 $16,550.11 $7,012.35 $2,098.12 
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236 

4 
GILLIG, LLC 

$11,728.46 $831.64 $6,660.06 $11,651.64 $ 14,116.41 $ 13,522.62 $ 7,079.55 $2,073.82 
HAYWARD, CA 

5 
AXLETECH NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
TROY Ml 48083 

6 
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY 

$12,014.64 $802.08 $6,572.06 $12,220.00 $ 14,805.00 $ 13,393.13 $ 6,974.10 $2,124.44 
MUNCIE, IN 

7 
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID 
BOCA RATON FL 

8 
MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID 
LOUISVILL, KY 

9 
PREVOST CAR, INC. 

$17,215.08 $856.48 $6,842.88 $12,499.76 $15,143.94 $13,891.54 $7,329.60 $2,133.12 
ELGIN, IL 

10 
CBM US INC. 

$15,735.80 NO BID $8,946.52 $15,698.28 $19,019.07 NOBID $9,511.95 $2,214.68 
CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138 

11 
MOHAWK MFG AND SUPPLY CO. 

NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID 
NILES, ILLINOIS 60714 

12 
MIDWEST BUS CORP $11,983.48 $809.32 $6,805.48 $11,905.92 $14,424.48 $13,160.14 $7,234.20 $2,119.12 
OWOSCO, Ml 48867 
TILES IN STYLE 

$31,410.92 $1,649.42 $18,190.26 $52,011.44 $63,013.86 $26,821.68 $18,926.25 $5,213.18 13 
WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527 

t I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. I have ~d(d v 1fied the prices stated herein. 

Manager of Procurement 

2 



METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY 
BID ABSTRACT 

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS 
SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000246 
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN 

NO NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 31 Item 32 Item 36 Item 37 Item 41 Item 43 REMARKS 

1 
NEOPART TRANSIT, LLC. 

$2,650.40 $2,650.40 $4,014.00 $1,005.20 $15,014.66 $10,088.90 
READING, PA 19608 

2 
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO., LLC 

$3,560.00 $4,080.00 $4,896.00 $1,162.00 $16,968.00 $13,856.00 
DELAWARE, OH 

3 
SOUTHERN COACH PARTS 

$2,895.60 $2,895.60 $4,054.32 $1,051.68 $18,114.35 $11,084.80 
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236 

4 
GILLIG, LLC 

$2,765.00 $2,765.00 $ 4,187.52 $ 1,048.46 $16,446.84 $11,366.25 
HAYWARD, CA 

5 
AXLETECH 

NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $14,548.80 
TROY, Ml 48083 

6 
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY 

$2,872.40 $2,872.40 $ 4,341.60 $ 1,102.08 $18,315.34 $12,253.90 
MUNCIE, IN 

7 
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID 
BOCA RATON, FL 

8 
MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES NOBID NOBID $4,478.40 $1,114.40 $17,826.50 NOBID 
LOUISVILL KY 

9 
PREVOST CAR, INC. 

$3,232.00 $3,514.80 $4,872.24 $1,079.68 $16,893.26 $12,253.90 
ELGIN, IL 

10 
CBM US INC. 

$2,968.00 $2,950.00 $4,484.16 $1,119.72 NOBID NOBID 
CAMBRIDGE MA 02138 

11 
MOHAWK MFG AND SUPPLY CO. 

NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID 
NILES, ILLINOIS 60714 

12 
MIDWEST BUS CORP 

$2,825.60 $2,825.60 $4,278.96 $1,071.56 $18,006.28 $10,868.30 
OWOSCO, Ml 48867 
TILES IN STYLE 

$6,901.00 $7,847.80 $8,966.16 $2,116.94 $30,827.22 $29,855.35 NON RESPONSIVE 13 
WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527 

I certi~I hate personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. 

/1/7 (, ..... 
Cdhtract Administrator 
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