METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

4017000246
09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS
SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN

NO

NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

REMARKS

SOUTHERN COACH PARTS

WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527

1 $8,865.36 $17,534.40 $12,557.60
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236
THE AFTE RKET PARTS CO., LLC

2 A S i $10,080.00 $44,800.00 $17,050.00
DELAWARE, OH
GILLIG, LL

3 » kLG $9,267.84 $40,047.20 $24,116.95
HAYWARD, CA

4 AXLETECH NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROY, Ml 48083

5 MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY $9,565.92 $41,024.00 $23,718.75
MUNCIE, IN

6 NEOPART TRANSIT,IELC; $8,883.36 $39,756.80 $22,015.40
READING, PA 19608

7 |VEMICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM NG BID $18,825.60 $13,093.30
BOCA RATON, FL

8 MOTORICORCHLINDOSTIRIES NO BID $24,256.00 $17,798.00
LOUISVILL, KY

9 FREVOST CAR; Ilic: $10,020.96 $22,300.80 $15,109.60
ELGIN, IL

10 SEBMILES fhe: $12,336.84 NO BID NO BID
CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138

- MOHAWK MFG AND SUPPLY CO. NO BID NG BID RO B
NILES, ILLINOIS 60714

12 [MIDWEST BUS CORP $9,470.16 $40,921.60 $23,469.60
OWOSCO, Mi 48867

43 |TILES IN STYLE $21,242.16 $108,288.80 $55,602.25

at | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

[Contract Administrator

| have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein,

Manager of Procurement






