DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF THERMO KING PARTS

SOLICITATION NO.:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4020000093
06/04/2020 @ 10:00AM

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

RECORDED BY: KRISTIAN PIPKINS

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO.[NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER ltem 1 ltem 2 Iltem 3 Iltem 4 Item 5 Iltem 6 Iltem 7 Iltem 8 Iltem 9 Item 10 Item 11 Item 12 Iltem 13
1 |Midwest Bus
Owosso, Ml $  40,791.16 | $3,435.87 | $185.15 |$2,806.68| $23,885.50 | $10,161.76 | $522.60 | NO BID | $240.04 $108,150.00 $11,616.75 | $54,649.56 | $4,296.04
2 [Southern Coach Parts Company
Birmingham,Alabama $43,370.40 |$3,744.59 | $222.18 |$2,992.62 | 24.406.30 | $10,744.44 | $580.40 | NO BID | $298.69 $107,975.25 $11,508.10 | $59,733.92 | $4,340.00
3 [Gillig LLC
Hayward, CA $53,335.80 |$3,331.66| $179.86 |%$3,467.22( $23,841.70 | $12,764.50 | $518.10 |$5,612.60| $331.16 $107,355.50 $14,740.65 | $59,707.40 | $4,225.41
4 |ABC Companies
Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 [Thermo King Of Houston
Houston, TX $40,384.52 |$2,790.89 | $152.26 |$2,897.28( 19.388.20 | $10,214.82 | $439.40 |$4,559.80| $283.56 $81,676.50 $12,059.25 | $46,344.04 | $3,372.95
6 [Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.
Niles, Illinois NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO.[NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 14 Item 15 Item 16 Item 17 Item 18 Item 19 Item 20 Item 21 Item 22 Item 23 Item 24 Item 25 Item 26

1 |Midwest Bus

Owosso, Ml $23,648.80 | $24,948.69 | $  4,103.06 | $1,411.68| $  5,461.74 | $91,711.20 | $32,935.30 | $6,540.93 | $47,228.20 | $55,188.12 | $9,171.15 | $28,736.27 | $5,518.76
2 |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $23,422.40 | $25,648.29 | $4,263.02 |$1,927.80| $5,517.54 |$91,585.85|$32,883.35 | $6,543.99 | $46,734.16 | $54,547.22 | $9,166.95 | $28,723.11 | $6,323.72
3 |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $28,008.60 | $24,552.78 | $3,968.47 |$1,404.88| $6,086.79 |$94,755.15|$28,840.35 | $6,353.37 | $46,608.12 | $54,563.86 | $12,893.70 | $33,299.50 | $6,978.40
4 |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $21,831.80 | $19,041.84 | $2,846.60 |$1,094.80| $4,834.98 |$71,080.95|%$23,100.65 | $5,071.68 | $35,466.00 | $39,288.60 | $10,100.10 | $26,581.79 | $5,609.24
6 |Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, lllinois NO BID [$25,909.05| NO BID NOBID | $2,988.90 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |$12,354.94| $5,731.50 | $18,194.64 | NO BID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO. |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Iltem 27 Iltem 28 Iltem 29 Item 30 Iltem 31 Item 32 Item 33 Item 34 Item 35 Item 36 Item 37 Item 38 Iltem 39
1. |Midwest Bus

Owosso, Ml $1,280.34 | $57,495.20 | $43,631.35 NO BID $62,238.96 | $10,931.44 | $5,980.52 | $1,644.72 | $107.14 $145.35 | $24,973.08| NOBID [$4,630.63
2. |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $1,438.32 | $57,672.16 | $43,572.20 NO BID $61,618.56 | $10,937.19 | $6,450.60 | $1,986.16 | $130.13 $175.65 | $24,983.64| NOBID |$4,813.21
3. |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $1,513.50 | $64,130.08 | $49,108.85 | $26,667.90 | $69,430.32 | $10,735.25 | $5,862.48 | $2,124.32 | $1,018.16 | $144.00 | $25,177.79 | $4,650.90 | $4,504.66
4. |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $1,230.78 | $48,317.92 | $37,184.70 | $19,404.82 | $52,571.76 | $8,527.25 |$4,772.56 | $1,649.12| $91.08 $121.20 | $19,722.89 | $4,120.20 | $3,631.71
6 [Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, Illinois $411.12 | $31,624.88 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $685.52 [ NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 40 Item 41 Item 42 Iltem 43 | Item 44 Item 45 Iltem 46 Iltem 47 Item 48 Item 49 Item 50 Item 51 Item 52
1. |[Midwest Bus

Owosso, Ml $1,934.53 | $1,019.44 | $86,882.67 | NO BID | $8,363.60 | $6,422.32 | $2,360.28 | $393.36 |$1,208.02 | $4,898.19 [ $3,059.34 | $4,861.44 | $20,248.65
2. |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $2,232.23 | $1,176.32 | $86,765.49 | NO BID | $8,890.24 | $6,601.04 | $2,634.96 | $452.98 |$1,400.12 | $5,206.85 | $3,143.28 | $5,544.00 | $22,837.70
3. |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $1,905.15 | $1,033.04 | $87,913.35 | NO BID | $8,147.84 | $7,446.08 | $2,630.28 | $384.67 |$1,180.14 | $4,787.53 [ $4,028.28 | $4,678.08 | $20,079.05
4, |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,312.00 | $20,426.20
5. |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $1,622.40 | $824.64 |$67,229.19 | NO BID | $6,361.44 | $6,166.48 | $2,197.80 | $322.85 | $928.88 |$3,821.84 ($3,139.92| $3,717.12 | $15,277.25
6 |Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, Illinois NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID [NOBID| NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 53 Item 54 Item 55 Item 56 Item 57 Item 58 Item 59 Item 60 Item 61 Item 62 Item 63 Item 64 Iltem 65
1. |[Midwest Bus

Owosso, Ml $1,103.44 | $6,134.28 | $14,038.64 | $12,369.63 | $107,238.88 | $26,926.83 | $2,191.84 | $123,510.00 | $1,161.66 | $20,659.51 | $166.12 |$3,420.20| $11,150.73
2. |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $1,271.92 | $7,032.56 | $16,084.44 | $14,171.22 | $107,146.48 | $26,769.33 | $2,334.50 | $123,990.70 | $1,286.49 | $21,965.33 | $221.40 |$3,455.00| $11,047.50
3. |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $1,047.28 | $5,937.08 | $13,157.78 | $11,896.29 | $105,441.84 | $26,093.34 | $2,442.72 | $119,901.30 | $7,354.33 | $19,713.09 | $178.82 |$3,272.56| $10,818.18
4, |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $918.32 | $4,717.16 | $10,504.60 | $9,635.85 | $79,838.64 | $20,440.56 | $2,041.06 | $91,241.00 | $991.42 | $16,244.88 | $155.08 |$2,734.52| $8,878.14
6 |Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, Illinois NOBID [ NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID [$1,318.24| NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 66 Iltem 67 Item 68 Item 69 Item 70 Item 71 Item 72 Item 73 Item 74 Item 75 Item 76 Item 77 Item 78
1. |[Midwest Bus

Owosso, Ml $1,949.16 | $17,973.80 | $3,798.48 | $435.75 | $543.95 |$1,241.73| $258.44 | $594.88 | $20,395.60 |$1,221.65|$6,599.24 |$4,023.68| $153.24
2. |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $1,999.14 | $18,040.45 | $4,354.56 | $494.70 | $626.06 |$1,933.47| $403.48 | $948.48 | $21,680.00 |$1,955.70|%$7,499.11 | $4,204.32|$1,635.06
3. |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $2,663.58 | $18,436.01 | $3,691.80 | $429.00 | $631.35 |$1,719.90| $287.84 | $580.32 | $26,855.20 |%$1,759.60 |$6,588.51 | $4,989.12 | $1,652.10
4, |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $1,936.98 | $13,959.92 [ $2,946.72 | $363.90 | $527.39 |$1,237.95| $208.04 | $456.56 | $22,329.20 |%$1,266.70 |$5,259.44 | $4,002.24 | $1,338.42
6 |Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, Illinois NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID [ NOBID | $740.88 | $152.32 | NO BID NO BID $739.35 | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

PAGE 6 OF 8




METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM

NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 79 Item 80 Iltem 81 Iltem 82 Item 83 Item 84 Item 85 Item 86 Item 87 COMMENTS
1. |Midwest Bus

Owosso, Mi $809.64 | $14,636.96 |$4,200.24 | $7,140.60 | $1,251.64 | $16,178.66 $434.75 $5,655.65 $31,385.86
2. |Southern Coach Parts Company

Birmingham,Alabama $1,223.43 | $15,788.76 | $4,441.80|%$7,529.04 [ $1,395.42 | $16,884.30 $676.50 $5,874.05 $34,493.30
3. |Gillig LLC

Hayward, CA $1,024.92 | $18,094.44 | $4,086.94 | $3,226.86 | $1,210.82| $20,539.00 $577.25 $4,635.05 $25,292.70
4. |ABC Companies

Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. |Thermo King Of Houston

Houston, TX $780.78 | $13,837.72 | $3,125.54  $2,639.52| $989.30 | $16,009.48 $459.75 $3,953.25 $20,656.60
6 [Mohawk MFG & Supply CO.

Niles, Illinois $282.75 | NoBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID |8 262.25|$ 274050 | $  20,466.86

| certify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Vanesaa Cloments

Contract Administrator
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I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

pd rencae

Manager of Procurement




METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT
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