

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF TURBOS AND ACTUATORS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4021000089

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/13/2021 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: KRISTIAN PIPKINS

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM												
		Item 1	Item 2	Item 3	Item 4	Item 5	Item 6	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	Item 11	Item 12	Item 13
1.	Cummins Inc Houston, Texas	\$44,507.12	\$189,498.40	\$27,047.20	\$155,521.40	\$11,902.40	\$441,639.60	\$96,850.88	\$213,523.80	\$56,355.12	\$42,467.04	\$41,947.20	\$203,025.52	\$8,148.48
2.	Kyrish Truck Centers Houston, Texas	\$47,841.78	\$203,664.30	\$36,195.88	\$208,126.31	\$12,792.24	\$474,654.96	\$104,091.52	\$229,196.40	\$60,541.56	\$56,832.16	\$45,082.71	\$160,387.40	\$8,757.60
3.	M&D Distributors Humble, Texas	No Bid	\$156,382.10	No Bid	\$159,808.14	\$8,640.88	\$364,458.24	\$79,925.44	\$175,986.00	\$50,068.50	\$54,979.02	No Bid	\$167,545.76	No Bid
4.	Northwest Drive Train Service Houston, Texas	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5.	Performance Truck Houston, Texas	\$49,977.34	\$206,604.30	\$37,811.68	\$217,417.16	\$11,448.28	\$481,505.28	\$105,593.28	\$232,503.60	\$61,589.91	\$59,369.31	\$45,818.19	\$220,118.12	\$9,148.56

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

*Vanessa Clemente*

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

*Raul Arenas*

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF TURBOS AND ACTUATORS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4021000089

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/13/2021 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: KRISTIAN PIPKINS

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM												
		Item 1	Item 2	Item 3	Item 4	Item 5	Item 6	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	Item 11	Item 12	Item 13
1.	Cummins Inc Houston, Texas	\$44,507.12	\$189,498.40	\$27,047.20	\$155,521.40	\$11,902.40	\$441,639.60	\$96,850.88	\$213,523.80	\$56,355.12	\$42,467.04	\$41,947.20	\$203,025.52	\$8,148.48
2.	Kyrish Truck Centers Houston, Texas	\$47,841.78	\$203,664.30	\$36,195.88	\$208,126.31	\$12,792.24	\$474,654.96	\$104,091.52	\$229,196.40	\$60,541.56	\$56,832.16	\$45,082.71	\$160,387.40	\$8,757.60
3.	M&D Distributors Humble, Texas	No Bid	\$156,382.10	No Bid	\$159,808.14	\$8,640.88	\$364,458.24	\$79,925.44	\$175,986.00	\$50,068.50	\$54,979.02	No Bid	\$167,545.76	No Bid
4.	Northwest Drive Train Service Houston, Texas	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5.	Performance Truck Houston, Texas	\$49,977.34	\$206,604.30	\$37,811.68	\$217,417.16	\$11,448.28	\$481,505.28	\$105,593.28	\$232,503.60	\$61,589.91	\$59,369.31	\$45,818.19	\$220,118.12	\$9,148.56

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

*Vanessa Clemente*

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

*Raul Arenas*

Manager of Procurement