DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF CUMMINS DIESEL ENGINE FUEL INJECTORS FOR METRO TRANSIT VEHILCES

SOLICITATION NO.;
BID DUE DATE/TIME:
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

4020000021
11/20/2019 2PM
11/21/2019 10AM

RECORDED BY: MELECHIA MILES/CSC

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR YEAR 1 & 2

NO E AND F BID
NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 1 Item 3 ltem & Item 9
2815-054-0043 2815-054-0049 2815-054-1047 2815-307-0004 Total
1 |M & D DISTRIBUTORS
,290.00 ,359, ,064. ,110. ,823.
HUMBLE, TX 77338 $10,290.0 $127,359.00 $206,064.00 $58,110.08 $401,823.08
2 |IMUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY
11,596.83 141,069.45 219,222, ,021. ,910.
MUNCIE, IN 47302 $11,5 $ 69 $219,222.72 $71,021.58 $442,910.58
3|ASPER ENGINE,&T SHISSIGHS $15,330.00 $208,260.00 $299,808.00 $81,634.00 $605,032.00
JASPER, IN 47547
4 NEGPART T SIT $17,658.27 $224,768.61 $311,722.56 $86,148.86 $640,298.30
READING, PA 19608 S o — e T N
5 |RUSH TRUCK CENTER
$16,036.02 $294,236.67 $419,925 60 $0.00 $730,198.29
HOUSTON, TX 77029
6 |GREEN DREAM INT.
$22,911.63 $224,063.73 $596,812.32 $0.00 $843,787.68
ERIE, PA 16501
7 |HOUSTON FREIGHTLINER
$17,114.58 $314,024.04 $448,165.44 $64,707.44 $844,011.50
HOUSTON, TX 77029
8 |KYRISH TRUCK CENTER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOUSTON, TX 77029
| have r and verified the prices stated herein.

G;fz | have pzfally cpened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator

/

Manager of Procurement
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