IFB 4021000008 - BID ABSTRACT

CUMMINS
CBM US Cummins Globe Interamerican Mohawk Mfg. & Muncie Transit Neopart Stewart & Thermo King Vehicle Maint. Kirk's
Inc. Inc. Connect LLC Motor, LLC Supply, Co. Supply Transit, LLC Stevenson Of Houston Program, Inc Automotive, Inc.
METRO PART MFG MFG PART [Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt. Total Bid Amt.
NUMBER NAME NUMBER Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2 Years 1&2
2710-001-0006 |FLEETGUARD AF55308 $17,218.25 $8,279.25 $15,750.00 No Bid $9,373.00 $8,974.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-001-0006 (DONALDSON F633483 $10,269.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,998.50 $10,081.75 No Bid $8,624.00 No Bid
2710-001-0020 (FLEETGUARD AF55005 $38,258 $27,450.50 $50,792.50 No Bid $29,452.50 $30,049.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-001-0067 [MCI 9G-3-37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-001-0067 |FLEETGUARD AF25668 No Bid $10,911.42 No Bid No Bid $12,369.24 $11,602.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13,281.84 No Bid
2710-001-0067 (DONALDSON DBA5065 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,434.52 $20,654.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-001-0093 |[FLEETGUARD AF25708-M |No Bid $19,306.00 No Bid No Bid $22,211.70 $20,719.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-001-0094 (FLEETGUARD AF25962 $19,973 $14,885.00 $27,112.80 No Bid $17,362.80 $16,060.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0042 |(BALDWIN B228 $300.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0042 (FLEETGUARD LF3338 No Bid $299.52 $944.64 No Bid $338.40 $315.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0044 [CUMMINS 2882674 No Bid No Bid $166,848.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0044 [(MCI 08-01-1464 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0044 |FLEETGUARD LF14000 No Bid $42,768.00 $72,846.40 No Bid $45,865.60 $45,909.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-002-0044 [CUMMINS 4367100 No Bid No Bid $130,697.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0054 |[DETROIT DIESEL INC. 102526 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0054 (FLEETGUARD FS19763 No Bid $8,480.10 $21,010.50 No Bid $9,101.10 $9,246.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0054 ([MCI 09-05-1385 ([No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0057 (MCI 08-01-1372 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0057 |[FLEETGUARD FF5636 $21,071 $20,748.00 $43,890.00 No Bid $22,382.00 $22,277.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0057 [CUMMINS 4940647 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0057 |US Prevost Parts N8894828 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0059 4934845 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0059 |[FLEETGUARD FF5632 $37,926 $37,304.15 $83,807.10 No Bid $40,942.20 $41,055.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0068 |MCI 08-01-1466 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0068 [CUMMINS 2893612 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0068 |(FLEETGUARD FF5776 No Bid $42,344.02 $77,462.64 No Bid $45,432.68 $45,662.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0070 [CUMMINS FS19764-G No Bid No Bid $50,206.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-003-0070 |(FLEETGUARD FS19764G No Bid $21,207.60 $50,206.80 No Bid $22,944.80 $23,392.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-009-0014 |NABIINC* 6303153 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-009-0014 [NELSON IND., IND. Q83284E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-009-0014 (FLEETGUARD HF6238 No Bid $2,108.40 No Bid No Bid $2,284.80 $2,254.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-017-0002 (DONALDSON P164378 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,267.58 $4,781.50 No Bid $4,096.76 No Bid
2710-017-0002 |(FLEETGUARD HF6553 No Bid $3,890.17 $8,000.80 No Bid $4,225.24 $4,238.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-019-0007 |ORION E0742129AB |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-019-0007 (FLEETGUARD AF25548 No Bid $38,503.21 $67,382.06 No Bid $46,748.54 $40,938.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42,940.34 No Bid
2710-029-0005 (FLEETGUARD NG5900 $53,287 $42,125.38 No Bid No Bid $45,192.84 $46,574.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2710-029-0005 |NABIINC* 6304295 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$340,610.72 $376,227.44 $369,269.42
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