BID ABSTRACT

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF TURBOS AND ACTUATORS FOR METRO's TRANSIT BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: Doc1448464768
BID OPENING DATE/TIME:

03/13/2025 @ 10:00AM

NO. |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER item 1 Item 2 item 3 item 4 Item 5 item 6 item 7 item 8 Item S item 10
M&D Distributors
1 |Houston, Texas $118,603.36 | $71,642.70 | $345,157.50 | $95,752.00 NO BID | $287,256.00 | $3,646.54 | $411,564.00 | $15,788.10 | $271,898.40
Cummins Southern Plains LLC
2 |Houston, Texas $137,436.80 | $102,426.30 | $442,197.00 | $176,439.00 | $85,128.75 | $529,314.00 | $5,219.37 | $524,239.20 | $23,657.70 | $358,191.00
NO. |INAME AND CITY OF BIDDER item 11 Item 12 item 13 Item 14 Item 15 Item 16 Item 1A Item 2A Item 3A Item 4A item 5A Item 6A | Item 7A
M&D Distributors
1 |Houston, Texas $81,194.10 NO BID $58,864.20 | NOBID $93,231.50 | $16,764.48 | $21,000.00 | $29,250.00 $90.00 $20,250.00 | NO BID | $60,750.00 | $300.00
Cummins Southern Plains LLC
2 |Houston, Texas $109,236.60 | $466,212.00 | $41,573.10 | $87,386.40 | $181.441.50 | $16,795.68 | $16,800.00 | $9,000.00 | $96.750.00 | $15,000.00 | $9,000.00 | $45.000.00 | $600.00
NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER item 8A item 9A Item 10A | Item 12A | Iitem 13A | Item 14A Item 15A | Item 16A REMARKS
M&D Distributors
1 |Houston, Texas $135,000.00 | $4,200.00 | $72,450.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID |[$46,555.00 ($3,724.80
Cummins Southern Plains LLC
2 |Houston, Texas $90,000.00 | $4,200.00 | $63,000.00 | $4,800.00 | $6,000.00 | $18,000.00 | $30,000.00 | $2,400.00

I certify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.
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Contract Adminsstrator

| have reviewed and venfied the prices stated herein.

Lreqory
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pe L8 LA 08 22COT

Manager of Procurement




