METRIO =
A
Rev. 7/28//2025 B —
DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF EXHAUST PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT BUSES
SOLICITATHON MO IFB DOC2004895483
RECORDED BY: ASHLEY CLARK
BID DUE DATE: 031 &r2026 TIME: 2:00 PM
BID OPENING DATE: 031 %2026 TIME: 10:00 AM
MO, NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER ftem 1A ltem 2A ltem 3A ltem 44 ltem 3A ltem A tem TA Rem BA Item 94 tem 104
1 CUMMING SOUTHERN PLAINS
HOUSTOM, TX 77028 :] 25 BB T4 | 335, 14848 | $190,203.83 | $44 DE2 24 | 5106,054.80) 510605480 | 511260874 [ 5 3323105 | 526540808 | $251,368.00
2 KIRK'S AUTOMOTIVE
DETROIT, Ml 48204 MO BID $25.4380.00 NO EBID MO BID WO BID NO BID WO BID MO BID $146 840.00 WO BID
3 MUNCIE TRAMNSIT SUPPLY
MUNCIE, IN 47202 5 A5 70205 | 57310088 | 323460830 | 35050072 | $160.43085( 512346040 | 516055451 | §  41,894.35 | 5333,315.36 | 5300204 0D
4 HOLT TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS
HOUSTON, TX 77028 5 2627588 | §58,912.05 | $200,74343 | $48.278.29 | $115.01582 | $11501580 | $12081168 | § 2005405 | $267058.11 | §272.810.31
5 WHITE ASSOCIATES
COHASSET, MA 02025 5 5036034 | 34087584 | 527400004 | SREE>D 32| S1BAER0DD| S135P1505| S1BEE2537 | § GDA4RE 12| 525788672 | $405.347.33
& RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS
HOUSTOMN, TX 77022 1 2662608 | 531,250.88 | $109.080.72 | $48.152.24 | 511530175 | 5 81570010 | 512528216 | § 23.,543.05 | 5161,662.24 | 5263.202.00
Item 11A Item 124 Item 134 Item 144 e 134 Item 164 Item 1TA ftem 194 ltenn 20A ltem 21A liem 224 ftemn 244 ftem 234 [tem 264 fem 2TA fem 284 Item 254
F M4086356(5 143200883 | % 2710650 (% 853470 |F 754645 | F 1263132B) 8§ S15117.00 ] $43,680083 | § 22370600 |5 2633460 |5 45537606 |5 42068743 |5 2600200 |§ 4358025 | % V00040 | % 203270 (% & 031 .55
NO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID NO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID
3 083032 (5 21303252 | % 24681440 | § 1059680 (% 1187185 NO BID MO BID MOBID [§ 29918672 |5 3123430 |5 5614220 |5 5267464 |5 3327874 |§ TI12DG10| % B34030 | % 250590 | % B545T0
$ 26553420 (5 15880749 |% 2322883 |§ 93279 (§ 783872 NO BID § 60758043 (351.20450 |5 24200048 |5 2672586 |5 4044241 |5 4524263 (5 2220547 |5 4508172 (% BT4ITT (F 21402 | % T.0E201
§ 42307084| 5 20225443 5 670X 11| 5 1963181 (F 1323000 | § 20923253 | 5126000000 57108456 | $3 31000065 |5 SE4D504 | $104 96190 | § DB 35545 MO BID 3 G585TR1|§ 1653210 | 5 520708 | § 15506.08
% 25626B16 (% 15524180|% 2345470 |§ 200270 (§ 7.803.30 NO BID § 64087080 ($51.00028 |5 23441138 |5 2653635 |5 4744500 |5 4468265 (5 2812238 |§ 4528305 |% 474710 (% 211785 | % T.221.80
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item 31A Item 334 ltenn 4B ltem 6B ltem 7B | Hem 138 lbem 178 ttem: 208 ftem 268 | Rem2TB | Hem 358 REMARKS

§ 33.766.28 | $207,558.50 | $2.369.00 | $18.,180.00 | % 7.823.00 | $1.51500 | 5142410.00 | § 1355200 | $4.235.00 | 32570000 | 571,205.00

NO BID MO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID WO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WO BID NO BID

¥ 41.013.00 MO BID NOEBID NOBID NOBID NO EBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

¥ 3509207 | $373,330.84 | 3541583 | 52321068 | $12.18581 | B2 41778 522727126 | § 21,663.30 | 56,780.73 | $4.110L30 | 500,908.51

5 6555478 | 577308132 | $4.200.00 | 522.500.00 | ¥ 9.450.00 [ §1.875.00 NOBID | 5262000.00 | $5.250.00 | $3.167.50 | $83,125.00

¥ 3405054 | 332209150 | 3248500 | 51847240 | ¥ 7,796.25 | $1,04685 | 5145405.60 | § 13.B60.00 | 4,331.25 | 3262870 | §72,702.80 | Non-Fesponsive

| certify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt. | have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.
greqgory Scott
VWM C[eW- WM Gregory Stott (Apr21, 2026 10:02:39 CDT)
Contract Administrator Manager of Procurement
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