

Description: Purchase and Delivery of Bus Brake Parts for METRO's Transit Vehicles

IFB NO. 4022000035

Bid Opening: 2/16/22

Time: 10:00am

					Mohawk Mfg. & Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	NEOPART TRANSIT LLC	Rush Truck Centers	New Flyer Industries	Vehicle Maintenance Program
MPN	MaterialDescription	Manufacturer Name	Manufacturer Part Number	Average Yearly Qty.	Total Cost Years 1&2	Total Cost Years 1&2	Total Cost Years 1&2	Total Cost Years 1&2	Total Cost Years 1&2	Total Cost Years 1&2
2530-194-0011	ROTOR - BRAKE REAR 17"	MAN	81.50803.0041	47	No Bid	\$11,032.31	No Bid	\$28,623.19	\$11,797.00	No Bid
2530-194-0011	ROTOR - BRAKE REAR 17"	NEW FLYER	6359347	47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$39,500.87	\$11,797.00	No Bid
2530-194-0010	ROTOR - BRAKE FRONT 17"	MAN	81.50803.0040	53	No Bid	\$12,006.09	No Bid	\$32,277.21	\$13,303.00	No Bid
2530-194-0010	ROTOR - BRAKE FRONT 17"	NEW FLYER	6347297	53	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$32,277.21	\$13,303.00	No Bid
2530-194-0008	ROTOR (NABI)	MERITOR	23123647002	89	No Bid	\$25,431.75	\$23,494.23	\$56,752.63	\$27,768.00	No Bid
2530-194-0008	ROTOR (NABI)	NABI INC*	6316229	89	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,494.23	\$45,738.88	\$27,768.00	No Bid
2530-194-0007	ROTOR, BRAKE - FRONT & REAR AXLES	US Prevost Parts	N8884457	250	No Bid	No Bid	\$135,689.25	\$144,980.00	\$161,000.00	No Bid
2530-194-0007	ROTOR, BRAKE-FRONT & REAR AXLE (NOVA)	BENDIX	K021958	250	No Bid	\$91,995.00	\$135,689.25	\$217,250.00	\$161,000.00	No Bid
2530-194-0006	ROTOR, RH.LH	DURABRAKE CO.	56642	62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$49,104.00	\$38,812.00	\$37,200.00
2530-194-0006	ROTOR, RH.LH	MCI	15-03-1012	62	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,930.44	\$49,104.00	\$38,812.00	No Bid
2530-194-0006	ROTOR, RH.LH	MERITOR	23123642002	62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-194-0006	ROTOR, RH.LH	MERITOR	23123642002	62	No Bid	No Bid	\$28,930.44	\$52,514.00	\$38,812.00	No Bid
2530-194-0006	ROTOR, RH.LH	WEBB	55060F	62	No Bid	\$19,502.10	No Bid	\$37,510.00	\$19,933.00	No Bid
2530-194-0005	ROTOR, BRAKE, FRONT AXLE (MCI)	DURABRAKE CO.	56641	50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$53,350.00	\$30,525.00	\$30,000.00
2530-194-0005	ROTOR, BRAKE, FRONT AXLE (MCI)	MCI	15-02-1067	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,019.94	\$28,801.30	\$30,525.00	No Bid
2530-194-0005	ROTOR, BRAKE, FRONT AXLE (MCI)	MERITOR	68326014	50	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,019.94	\$28,801.30	\$30,525.00	No Bid
2530-194-0005	ROTOR, BRAKE, FRONT AXLE (MCI)	WEBB	54220F	50	No Bid	\$15,727.50	No Bid	\$28,801.30	\$16,075.00	No Bid
2530-064-0074	ASSEMBLY,HUB & ROTOR(DRIVE-EX225 DC-BRK)	MCI	15-03-1003	14	No Bid	No Bid	\$42,624.78	No Bid	\$37,195.20	No Bid
2530-064-0074	ASSEMBLY,HUB & ROTOR(DRIVE-EX225 DC-BRK)	MERITOR	16160611005PST	14	No Bid	\$44,556.82	\$42,624.78	\$33,880.00	\$37,195.20	No Bid
2530-095-1009	CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - RH (NOVA)	BENDIX	K002965	31	No Bid	No Bid	60743.22	\$79,860.00	\$76,896.60	No Bid
2530-095-1009	CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - RH (NOVA)	NOVA	N8900769	31	No Bid	No Bid	60743.22	\$79,860.00	\$65,241.00	No Bid
2530-095-1008	CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - LH (NOVA)	BENDIX	K002964	31	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,743.22	\$75,020.00	\$72,236.20	No Bid
2530-095-1008	CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - LH (NOVA)	NOVA	N8900765	31	No Bid	No Bid	\$60,743.22	No Bid	\$72,236.20	No Bid
2530-095-1005	CALIPER-LH, FRT, REAR, TRL AXLE (MCI)	MCI	04-01-1115	26	No Bid	No Bid	44110.56	\$63,085.00	\$60,555.40	No Bid
2530-095-1005	CALIPER-LH, FRT, REAR, TRL AXLE (MCI)	MERITOR	EX225H202R	26	No Bid	\$53,769.81	44110.56	\$63,085.00	\$60,555.40	No Bid
2530-095-1005	CALIPER-RH, FRT, REAR, TRL AXLE (MCI)	MERITOR	EX225H202XX000	26	No Bid	No Bid	57957.28	\$63,085.00	\$80,184.60	No Bid
2530-095-1004	CALIPER-LH, FRT, REAR,TRL AXLE (MCI)	MERITOR	EX225H201XX000	18	No Bid	No Bid	\$40,124.27	\$36,630.00	\$46,558.80	No Bid
2530-095-1004	CALIPER-RH, FRT, REAR,TRL AXLE (MCI)	MERITOR	EX225H201R	18	No Bid	\$31,221.18	\$30,538.08	\$36,630.00	\$35,161.20	No Bid
2530-095-1001	CALIPER ASM - LEFT HAND W/O CARRIER	NOVA	N80666	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,737.60	No Bid
2530-095-1001	CALIPER ASM - LEFT HAND W/O CARRIER	ZF	050122039901	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,737.60	No Bid
2530-095-1000	CALIPER - RIGHT HAND, FRONT (NOVA)	BENDIX	K003810	11	No Bid	\$13,709.08	\$13,555.54	\$16,940.00	\$16,117.20	No Bid
2530-095-1000	CALIPER - RIGHT HAND, FRONT (NOVA)	NOVA	N86631	11	No Bid	No Bid	\$13,555.54	No Bid	\$16,117.20	No Bid
2530-095-1000	CALIPER - RIGHT HAND, FRONT (NOVA)	ZF	050122039801	11	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,117.20	No Bid
2530-095-0040	CALIPER - FRNT STRT SIDE & REAR CURB SID	NEW FLYER	7700158	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,839.20	No Bid
2530-095-0040	CALIPER - FRNT STRT SIDE & REAR CURB SID	WEBB	KR1400A-01	24	No Bid	\$26,577.84	No Bid	\$49,209.60	\$29,839.20	No Bid
2530-095-0033	CALIPER - FRONT CURB & REAR STREET SIDE	NEW FLYER	7700164	26	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$32,325.80	No Bid
2530-095-0033	CALIPER - FRONT CURB & REAR STREET SIDE	WEBB	KL1400A-01	26	No Bid	\$28,792.66	No Bid	\$53,310.40	\$32,325.80	No Bid

Description: Purchase and Delivery of Bus Brake Parts for METRO's Transit Vehicles

IFB NO. 4022000035

Bid Opening: 2/16/22

Time: 10:00am

					Mohawk Mfg. & Supply Co.	Muncie Transit Supply	NEOPART TRANSIT LLC	Rush Truck Centers	New Flyer Industris	Vehicle Maintenance Program
2530-330-0004	KIT-MTG.CALIPERS-TORQUE PLATE REAR AXLE	MCI	04-01-1121	46	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,165.65	No Bid	\$4,843.80	No Bid
2530-330-0004	KIT-MTG.CALIPERS-TORQUE PLATE REAR AXLE	MERITOR	KIT225208	46	No Bid	\$4,846.10	\$4,165.65	\$5,768.40	\$4,843.80	No Bid
2530-330-0003	KIT-MTG.CALIPER TORQUE PLATE, FRT AXLE	NABI INC*	6315691	62	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,172.56	\$16,504.40	\$6,014.00	No Bid
2530-330-0003	KIT-MTG.CALIPERS-TORQUE PLATE	MCI	04-01-1120	62	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,172.56	No Bid	\$6,014.00	No Bid
2530-330-0003	KIT-MTG.CALIPERS-TORQUE PLATE	MERITOR	KIT225205	62	No Bid	\$6,015.86	\$5,172.56	\$12,958.00	\$6,014.00	No Bid
2530-089-0011	KIT - BRAKE PAD	NEW FLYER	6485765	8	No Bid	\$3,717.20	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,148.00	No Bid
2530-089-0011	KIT - BRAKE PAD	BREMSKERL	MDK-5014	8	\$1,870.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0010	KIT, DISC PAD - NABI	MERITOR	KIT2252H2BA	109	No Bid	\$50,646.85	\$36,794.04	\$23,980.00	\$56,516.50	No Bid
2530-089-0010	KIT, DISC PAD - NABI	NABI INC*	633-5104	109	No Bid	No Bid	\$36,794.04	No Bid	\$56,516.50	No Bid
2530-089-0010	KIT, DISC PAD - NABI	BREMSKERL	MDK-5014	109	\$25,489.65	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0009	KIT, DISC BRAKE PAD	MERITOR	KIT2252H2BA2	4	No Bid	\$1,858.60	\$1,350.24	\$880	\$2,074.00	No Bid
2530-089-0009	KIT, DISC BRAKE PAD	ORION	E0202561DA	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,350.24	\$880	\$2,074.00	No Bid
2530-089-0009	KIT, DISC BRAKE PAD	BREMSKERL	MDK-5014	4	\$935.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0008	KIT, BRAKE PAD (NOVA)	US Prevost Parts	N8902138	285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$61,560.00	No Bid
2530-089-0008	KIT, BRAKE PAD (NOVA)	TMD FRICTION INC	TEXTAR 2927802	285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$72,105.00	\$61,560.00	No Bid
2530-089-0008	KIT, BRAKE PAD (NOVA)	BREMSKERL	MDK-5013	285	\$66,647.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0006	KIT-DISC PAD RETAINING(F,R,TRL MCI)	NABI INC*	6316222	106	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,161.68	No Bid	\$1,350.44	No Bid
2530-089-0006	KIT-DISC PAD RETAINING(F,R,TRL MCI)	NEW FLYER	6477920	106	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,161.68	No Bid	\$1,350.44	No Bid
2530-089-0006	KIT-DISC PAD RETAINING(FRT,REAR,TRL MCI)	MCI	04-01-1117	106	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,161.68	No Bid	\$1,350.44	No Bid
2530-089-0006	KIT-DISC PAD RETAINING(FRT,REAR,TRL MCI)	MERITOR	KIT225210	106	No Bid	\$1,349.38	\$1,161.68	\$1,609.08	\$1,350.44	No Bid
2530-089-0005	KIT-PAD	MERITOR	KIT2252H2CD	176	No Bid	No Bid	\$38,576.38	\$38,720.00	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0005	KIT - PAD (FRONT, REAR TRL. AXLE MCI)	MCI	04-01-1113CG	176	No Bid	No Bid	\$38,576.38	\$38,720.00	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0005	KIT-DISC BRAKE PAD FT, REAR,TRL AXLE MCI	MOHAWK	MDK-5010	176	\$37,681.60	No Bid	\$38,576.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0005	KIT - PAD	BREMSKERL	MDK-5010	176	\$37,681.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0005	KIT-DISC BRAKE PAD FT, REAR,TRL AXLE MCI	WINNARD	373064	176	No Bid	\$34,420.32	\$38,576.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2530-089-0004	KIT - BRAKE PAD N2G	MAN	81.50820-6070	95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26,334.00	No Bid
2530-089-0004	KIT - BRAKE PAD N2G	NEW FLYER	6447341	95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24,035.00	\$26,334.00	No Bid
2530-089-0004	KIT - BRAKE PAD N2G	BREMSKERL	MDK-5013	95	\$22,215.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
					\$24,086.55	\$240,053.82	\$243,684.74	\$58,740.00	\$78,297.60	\$0.00

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Fatima Rubio

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Raul Arenas

Manager of Procurement