METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF BRAKE PARTS FOR METRO's TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: 4024000188
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/05/2024 @ 10:00AM
NO. |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 1 Item 2 Item 3 Item 6 Item 12 Item 14 Item 15 Item 16 Item 17 Item 18 Item 19 Item 20 Item 21
The Aftermarket Parts Company
1 |Delaware, OH $1,946.40 [$251,280.00 |$97,650.00 |$34,260.00 ($3,211.20 |$38,250.00 [$30,600.00 |$7,650.00 [$7,650.00 |$304,521.00 |$268,695.00 |$10,755.00 [$10,755.00
Muncie Transit Supply
2 |Muncie, IN $2,373.24 |$328,252.00 |$113,518.00 |[NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $318,984.60 |NO BID NO BID NO BID
CBMUS
3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID NO BID NO BID $56,162.00 |NO BID $72,145.80 |$57,716.64 |$17,321.28 |$17,321.28 |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Neopart Transit
4 |Reading, PA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $49,609.05 |$39,687.24 |$9,921.81 [$9,921.81 |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicle Maintenance Program
5 |Boca Raton, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

| certify that | have personally opened and
read all bids received by the time set for

Vineasa (lomenta—~ sat

Contract Administrator
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METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVE

SOLICITATION NO.: 4024000184
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/05/2024
NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 22 Item 23 Item 24 Item 25 Item 26 Item 27 Item 28 Item 29 Item 32 Item 33 Item 34 Item 35 Item 41
The Aftermarket Parts Company
1 |Delaware, OH $981.00 |$4,214.25 [$5,355.00 ($4,214.25 |$7,092.00 |$6,075.00 |$7,092.00 |$6,075.00 [$810,918.00 |$991,122.00 |$355,677.00 |$386,163.60 |$193,446.00
Muncie Transit Supply
2 |Muncie, IN $5,629.14 [$4,440.42 ($5,629.14 [$4,440.42 |$8,103.87 |$6,938.43 |$8,103.87 [$6,938.43 |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $292,186.40
CBMUS
3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Neopart Transit
4 |Reading, PA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID |$495,449.46 |$605,549.34 |$186,754.26 ($202,761.77 |$366,215.29
Vehicle Maintenance Program
5 |Boca Raton, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $564,216.12 [$714,579.14 |$240,867.83 |$261,513.64 |$364,338.04

| certify that | have personally opened and
read all bids received by the time set for

Vaneaza (oments~Ueat

Contract Administrator
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVE

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO.: 4024000188
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/05/2024 RECORDED BY: La Tonya Chriswell
NO. [NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 42 Item 43 Item 44 Item 48 Item 49 Item 53 Item 55 REMARKS
The Aftermarket Parts Company
1 |Delaware, OH $90,225.00 |$45,866.25 [$33,975.00 [$33,586.20 |$28,705.50 |$245,212.50 |$481,380.00
Muncie Transit Supply
2 |Muncie, IN $92,475.00 |NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $384,104.50 [NO BID
CBM US
3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID $86,389.20 ($63,992.00 [NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Neopart Transit Non-Responsive (Items 32, 33, 34, 35,
4 |Reading, PA $97,362,72 |NO BID NO BID $20,639.00 |$17,199.17 |NO BID $607,898.51 (48 & 49)
Vehicle Maintenance Program Non-Responsive (Items 32, 33, 34, 35,
5 |Boca Raton, FL $115,375.80 |NO BID NO BID $26,318.81 |$21,932.34 (NO BID $555,659.87 |48 & 49)

| certify that | have personally opened and

read all bids received by the time set for

Vianeasa (lpmenta—UWeat

Contract Administrator

| have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

_7“?44/‘4 Seatt

Manager of Procurement
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