DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF BRAKE PARTS FOR METRO's TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.:

4024000188

BID OPENING DATE/TIME:  09/05/2024 @ 10:00AM RECORDED BY: LaTonya Chriswell
THE AFTERMARKET Vehicle
Muncie Transit PARTS COMPANY DBA Maintenance
CBM US Inc. Supply Neopart Transit NFI PARTS Program, Inc
METRO Manufacturer ESTIMATED
Part Approved Part QUANTITY |UO| TOTAL BID PRICE | TOTAL BID PRICE | TOTAL BID PRICE [ TOTAL BID PRICE YEARS 1{ TOTAL BID PRICE
# Items Number Manufacturer Number PER YEAR | M YEARS 1-3 YEARS 1-3 YEARS 1-3 3 YEARS 1-3
HO-1 |DRUM-BRAKE, REAR AXLE, 100 GRADE 2530-007-0036 |KINETIK 5312400NFA 4 EA No Bid 52,373.24 No Bid $1,946.40 No Bid
HO0-2 |DRUM-BRAKE,REAR 2530-007-0039 |KINETIK 5329620NFA 400 EA No Bid $328,252.0 No Bid $251,280.00 No Bid
#0-3 |DRUM-BRAKE FRONT 2530-007-0040 (KINETIK 5336592NFA 200 EA $113,518.0 No Bid $97,650,00 No Bid
#0-4 |ASSEMBLY,HUB & ROTOR(DRIVE-EX225 DC-BRK} 2530-064-0074 |{MERITOR 16 16061 1005 62 EA $434,012.40 $370,061.88 No Bid $399,335.86
H#0-5 |KIT - UNEVEN WEAR (SN7) FRONT BRAKE 2530-085-0004 |BENDIX K109244 B EA No Bid 52,136.48 52,914.44 53,162.00 $4,142.10
#0-6 |KIT - BRAKE PAD N2G 2530-089-0004 |AG MAN B1.50820.6083 100 EA $56,162.00 No Bid No Bid $34,260.00 No Bid
#0-7 |[KIT-DISC BRAKE PAD FT, REAR,TRL AXLE MC| 2530-089-0005 |THOS WINNARD 373064 165 EA No Bid $60,673.80 $123,764.26 $132,462.00 $143,726.39
}#0-8 |KIT-DISC PAD RETAINING({FRT,REAR,TRL MCI) 2530-089-0006 |MERITOR KIT225210 70 EA No Bid 51,799.0 51,194.90 $1,984.50 No Bid
#0-9 [KIT, BRAKE PAD {NOVA) 2530-089-0008 |TMD EXTAR 2827802 230 _mb $72,636,30 $ 104,930.6 No Bid $98,670.00 No 8id
#0-10 |KIT, DISC BRAKE PAD 2530-089-0009 |MERITOR KIT2252H2BA2 8 _m__; No Bid $6,082.72 $6,000.72 $6,422.40 No Bid
#0-11 |KIT-DISC BRAKE PAD, NABI 2530-089-0010 |MERITOR MMD1311AF 80 EA No Bid 560,827.2 538,258.40 $64,224.00 5 43,905.92
#0-12 |KIT - BRAKE PAD 2530-089-0011 |BREMSKERL MDK-5014 4 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,211.20 No Bid
#0-14 |CALIPER - FRONT STREET SIDE DIC BRAKE 2530-095-0022 [AG MAN 81.50804.6669 15 EA $72,145.8 $ 49,609.05 $38,250.00 No Bid
#0-15 |CALIPER - BRAKE, FRONT CURBSIDE 2530-095-0023 |AG MAN B1.50804.6670 12 EA $ 57,716.64 $ 39,687.24 $30,600.00 No Bid
#0-16 |DISC - BRAKE CALIPER ASSY, RR CS W/O 2530-095-0028 |AG MAN 81.50804.6652 3 EA $17,321.28 $9,921.81 $7,650.00 No B8id
#0-17 |DISC - BRAKE CALIPER ASSY, RR SS W/O 2530-095-0028 |AG MAN 81,50804,6651 3 EA $17,321.28 $9,921.81 $7,650.00 No Bid
#0-18 |CALIPER - FRONT CURB & REAR STREET SIDE 2530-095-0033 |WEBB KL1400A-01 170 EA No Bid $318,984.6 No Bid $304,521.00 ° No Bid
HO-19 |CALIPER - FRNT STRT SIDE & REAR CURB SID 2530-095-0040 |WEBB KR1400A-01 150 EA No Bid $ 281,457.0 No Bid $268,695.00 No Bid
HO-20 |CALIPER - BRAKE ASM STREETSIDE CENTER 2530-095-0041 |ZF 501220905 3 EA No Bid No Bid $10,755.00 No Bid
?O.NH CALIPER - BRAKE ASM CURBSIDE CENTER 2530-095-0042 |ZF 501220904 3 EA No Bid No Bid $10,755.00 No Bid
H0-22 |CALIPER - FRONT SS W/CARRIER [NOVA WEBB) 2530-095-0043 |WEBB KL1400B-04 3 EA No Bid $5,629.14 No Bid $981.00 No Bid
#0-23 |CALIPER - FRONT SS SENSOR (NOVA WEBB) 2530-095-0044 |WEBB KL14008 3 EA No Bid $ 4,440,42 No Bid $4,214.25 No Bid
H0-24 |CALIPER - FRONT CS W/CARRIER (NOVA WEBB) 2530-095-0045 |WEBB KR1400B-04 3 EA No Bid 55,629.14 No Bid $5,355.00 No Bid
H0-25 |CALIPER - FRONT CS SENSOR [NOVA WEBB) 2530-095-0046 |WEBB KR14008 3 EA No Bid S 4,440.42 No Bid $4,214.25 No Bid
#0-26 |CALIPER - RR/CTR SS W/CARRIER NOVA WEBB 2530-095-0047 |WEBB KLE900B-D2 3 EA No Bid $8,103.87 No Bid $7,092,00 No Bid
HO-27 |CALIPER - RR/CTR S5 SENSR NOVA WEBB 2530-095-0048 {WEBB KLESOOB 3 EA No Bid $ 6,938.43 $6,075.00 No Bid
H0-28 |CALIPER - RR/CTR CS W/CARRR NOVA WEBB 2530-095-0049 |WEBB KR63008-02 3 EA No Bid $8,103.87 $7,092,00 No Bid
H0-29 |CALIPER - RR/CTR CS SENSR NOVA WEBB 2530-095-0050 |WEBB KR6900B 3 EA No Bid 56,938.43 No Bid $6,075.00 No Bid
H0-30 [CALIPER - RIGHT HAND, FRONT {NOVA} 2530-095-1000 |BENDIX K003810 110 EA 5260,056.50 $274,788.8 $269,335.19 $282,810.00 $264,957.00
#0-31 |CALIPER ASM - LEFT HAND W/O CARRIER 2530-095-1001 |[NOVA NBD666 120 EA $283,698.00 No Bid No Bid $308,520.00 No Bid
#0-32 |CALIPER-LH, FRT, REAR,TRL AXLE (MCI} 2530-095-1004 |MERITOR EX225H201XX000 180 _m.P No Bid No Bid £ 495,449.46 $810,918.00 $564,216,12
#0-33 |CALIPER-LH, FRT, REAR, TRL AXLE {MCI) 2530-095-1005 |MERITOR EX225H202XX000 220 _m_) No Bid No Bid $ 605,549.34 $991,122.00 $714,579.14
#0-34 |CALIPER ASSY-DISC BRAKE C/S (NABI) 2530-095-1006 |MERITOR EX225H302XX000 70 _m__P No Bid No Bid $ 186,754.26 $355,677.00 $240,867.83




ﬁ.«o.wm CALIPER ASSY-DISC BRAKE R/S (NABI) 2530-095-1007 |MERITOR EX225H301XX000 76 EA No Bid No Bid $202,761.70 $386,163.60 $261,513.64
_zo.wm CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - LH (NOVA) 2530-095-1008 |BENDIX K002964 140 EA $329,967.40 No Bid $529,794.53 $559,860.00 $563,805.06
_z|o.ww CALIPER ASSY, DISC BRAKE - RH (NOVA)] 2530-095-1003 |BENDIX K002565 150 EA $353,536.50 No Bid $567,637.00 $599,850.00 $557,111.85
1#0-38 |CALIPER TO TORQUE PLATE KIT CS/5S (NAB1} 2530-095-1010 |MERITOR KIT225206 12 EA No Bid 513,825.12 $2,853.45 $4,071.60 $3,352.92
#0-39 |ROTOR, BRAKE, FRONT AXLE (MCI) 2530-194-0005 |DURABRAKE 56641 60 EA No Bid $30,474.0 $68,378,69 $28,620.00 $24,364.20
#0-40 |ROTOR, RH/LH MCI DRIVE/B AXLE 2530-194-0006 |DURABRAKE 56642 150 EA No Bid $ 76,185.0 $210,767.76 $173,250.00 $60,910.50
#0-41 |RDTOR, BRAKE-FRONT & REAR AXLE (NOVA) 2530-194-0007 |BENDIX K0DZ1958 440 EA No Bid 5292,186.4 $366,215.29 $193,446.00 $364,338.04
#0-42 |ROTOR [NABI) 2530-194-0008 |MERITOR 23123647002 150 EA No Bid $92,475.0 597,362.72 $90,225.00 $115,375.80
#0-43 |ROTOR - BRAKE FRONT 17" 2530-194-0010 |AG MAN 81.50803.0040 135 _m> 586,389.2 No Bid No Bid S 45,866.25 No Bid
#0-44 |ROTOR - BRAKE REAR 17" 2530-194-0011 |AG MAN 81.50803.0041 100 _m___.. $63,992.0 No Bid No Bid $33,975.00 No Bid
#0-45 |KIT-MTG.CALIPER TORQUE PLATE, FRT AXLE 2530-330-0003 |MERITOR KIT22505 130 EA No Bid $21,083.4 513,898.98 $22,620.00 $16,715.40
H0-46 |KIT-MTG.CALIPER TORQUE PLATE, REAR AXLE 2530-330-0004 |MERITOR KIT225208 200 EA No Bid $ 35,960.0 $ 28,264.32 $37,800.00 $33,202.00
#0-48 |KIT - CALIPER, BRAKE ROADSIDE 2530-477-0002 |MERITOR £X225H310XX000 6 EA No Bid No Bid $20,639.00 $33,586.20 $26,318.81
HD-49 |KIT - CALIPER, BRAKE ROADSIDE 2530-477-0003 |MERITOR EX225H309XX000 5 EA No Bid No Bid §17,199.17 $28,705,50 $21,932.50
#0-50 |KIT - HUB  (NOVA ARTIC) 2530-495-0001 |ZF TRANSMISSION INC. 4472.298.186 10 EA $37,501.3 No Bid No Bid $36,300.00 No Bid
#0-52 |Webb UltraGrip Air Disc Brake Pads 2530-089-0015 |WEBB WwsD1311 650 EA No Bid $273,734.50 No Bid $ 274,950.0 No Bid
#0-53 |Webb UltraGrip Air Disc Brake Pads 2530-089-0016 |WEBB WwsD1203 650 EA No Bid $ 384,104.5 No Bid $245,212.50 No
#0-54 |BRAKE SHOES WITH LINING FRONT{127K}PAIR 2530-085-1060 |MERITOR S52F787T4715C 202 EA No Bid $269,373.06 $253,229.03 $301,788.00 $244,211.94
#0-55 | BRAKE SHOES WITH LINING REAR{127A)PAIR 2530-085-1061 |MERITOR S2F787T472BCP 452 EA No Bid No Bid $607,898.51 $481,380.00 $555,659.87
$1,299,894.70 $336,544.78 $415,515.90 $4,877,199.15 $382,756.96

| have reviewed and verifjgl the prices stated herein.
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