DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF
AXLES FOR METRO’S TRANSIT BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFB Doc1272303925

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY

BID ABSTRACT

RECORDED BY: LAUREN ROBERTSON

BID DUE DATE: 11/20/2024 TIME: 2:00 PM
BID OPENING DATE: 11/21/2024 TIME: 10:00 AM
NO. NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER REMARKS
Line 1 Line 2 Line 3 Line 4 Line 5 Line 6 Line7 Line 8
GRACEFUL HEIGHTS MINISTRIES
1 . . . . . . . . - i
LOUISVILLE, KY 40212 $204.00 $204.00 $630.00 $567.00 $594.00 $900.00 $126.00 $585.00 Non- Responsive
2 NEOPART TRANSIT LLC $75,534.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
READING, PA 19608
GILLIG LLC
HAYWARD, CA 94545 $72,441.09 | $28,073.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY DBA
4 |NFI PARTS $104,271.00 No Bid $30,242.70 | $165,428.91| $285,412.23| $436,064.04 §16 224.57 | $463,292.01
DELAWARE, OH 43015
TRIPPLE A LLC Non- Responsive
GRAND PRAIRIE, TX 75054 $61,000.00 | $61,000.00 | $336,315.18 | $205,372.19| $311,290.95| $459,767.37 | $75,418.09 | $226,254.27
AJUWA AUTOMOBILE AND PARTS LLC Non- Responsive
6 FORT WORTH, TEXAS 76137 $66,000.00 | $66,000.00 | $351,315.18 | $220,372.20| $326,290.95| $468,767.37 | $78,418.09 | $235,254.27
7

| certify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Fatzana b

Contract Administrator

97/259

| have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Gregory Scott

Gregory Scott (Jan 7, 2025 11:32 CST)

Manager of Contracts





