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BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SENSORS AND VALVES FOR METRO's TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: Doc1274017357
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 11/07/12024 @ 10:00AM
NO. |[MAME AND CITY OF BIDDER ftem 2 Item 3 item 4 Item 5 Item 6 Item 7
Cummins Southern Plains
1 |Houston, TX $234,886.26 $141,637.68 $69,067.44 $72,049.50 $83,579.16 $117,807.84
Crossline Supply LLC
2 |Delaware, OH NO BID NO BID MO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CBM US
3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID $202,622.64 $69,693.78 $79,106.25 NO BID $128,919.84
Muncie Transit Supply
4 |Muncie, IN NO BID $1686,553.92 $70,228.08 $77,502.75 NO BID $153,639.60
Redevelopment Construction
5 |New York, NY $97.800.00 $165,600.00 $78,390.00 $56.,260.00 $52.026.00 $25,200.00
Rush Truck Centers
6 |Houston, TX $259,846.45 $156,685.20 $76,408.20 $86,683.75 $92,460.70 $127,771.68
The Aftermarket Parts Company
7 |Delaware, OH NO BID $204,019.20 $95,940.00 $107,606.25 NO BID $1569,120.00
Trippte ALLC
8 |Dallas, TX $439,117.11 $263,938.80 $128,716.28 $144,741.75 $156,249.68 $210,792.00
White Associates
9 |Cohasset, MA $364,305.00 $219,144.00 $109,746.00 $124,125.00 $129,630.00 $182,712.00

| certify that | have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Vanesaa (limaente~Weat

Contract Administrator
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DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SENSORS AND VALVES FOR METRO's TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: Doc12740173567
BID OPEMING DATEITIME:  11/07/2024 @ 10:00AM

NO. [NAME AMD CITY OF BIDDER Item 9 tem 10 Item 11 Itemn 12 item 13 item 14 Item 16 Item 17

Cummins Scuthern Plains

1 |Houston, TX $178,018.37 $248,534.07 $118,140.33 $94,603.74 $85,449.60 $102,023.34 $94,160.64 $157,071.18
Crossline Supply LLC

2 |Delaware, OH NO BID $240,916.00 NO BID $67,914.00 $92,1684.00 NO 8ID NO BID NO 8ID
CBMUS

3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID NO BID $169,021.19 $137,448.08 $122,240.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Muncie Transit Supply

4 |Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID $129,612.81 $124,607.56 $108,455.12 NO BID NO 8ID NO BID
|Redevelopment Construction

5 |New York, NY $69,750.00 $145,770.00 $34,695.00 $115,500.00 $62,928.00 $65,700.00 $48,720.00 $61,750.00
Rush Truck Centers

6 |Houston, TX $196,926.57 $274,940.30 $131,005.75 $100,392.60 $94,528.16 $112,865.30 $104,167.84 $173,762.35
The Aftermarket Parts Company

7 |Detaware, OH NO BID NO BID $170,593.75 $136,752,00 $118,983.60 NO BiD NO BID NO BiD
Tripple ALLC

8 |Dallag, TX $326,260.74 $464,639.05 $260,677.67 $176,924.44 $169,235.44 $190,735.96 $164,641.60 $293,641.64
White Associates

g9 |Cohasset, MA $292,485.00 $372,222.00 $191,465.00 $152,922.00 $437,080.00 $169,141.00 $143,696.00 $243,615.00

| certify that | have personally opened and

Vaneaasa Clomaents~U/eat-

Contract Administrator




Summary of Procurement Page 6
IFB No. Doc12740173

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF SENSORS AND VALVES FOR METRO's TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: Doc1274017357
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 11/07{2024 @ 10:00AM
NO. |NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER Item 2A ftem 6A Item 9A Item 10A Item 14A Item 16A ftem 17A REMARKS

Cummins Southern Plains

1 |Houston, TX $112,225.50 $39,933.00 $18,832,50 $22,862.50 $20,695.50 $38,556.00 $75,046.50
Crossline Supply LLC

2 |Delaware, OH NO BID NO BID NO BID $50,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
camus

3 |Cambridge, MA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Muncie Transit Supply

4 |Muncie, IN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Redevelopment Construction

S [New York, NY $139,635.00 $82,650.00 $207,855.00 $244,080.00 $101,105.00 $74,760.00 $56,244.00 |Non-Responsive
Rush Truck Centers

6 |Houston, TX $89,545.68 $31,862.88 $15,026.01 $18,257.41 $16.512.60 $30,764,16 $59,880.24
The Aftermarket Parts Company

7 |Delaware, OH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tripple ALLC

8 |Dallas, TX $439,113.85 $562,871.06 $24,934.23 $30,296.43 $27,400.55 $51,047.92 $99,361.13

iie Associates
9 |Cohasset, MA $103,912.50 $36,975.00 $17,437.50 $21,187.50 $46,537.50 $35,700.00 $69,487.50

| eertify that | have personally opened and

Vaneassa Cloments~UWeat-

Contract Administrator

| have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.




